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THE YEAR IN REVIEW 

  PRESIDENT’S FOREWORD

Like most people I would 
imagine we have got to the 
end of 2014 and we are 
asking ourselves where the 
year has gone, it only 
seems like the other day 
that we were listening to 
Deputy Prime Minister 
Warren truss giving us his 

insights into the issues that lay ahead for the 
Commonwealth Government. 

It has certainly been a year like no other, I 
certainly don’t need to be reminding everyone 
how hard it is out there at the moment, I think 
every business entity, from Federal, State and 
Local Governments, large mining companies, 
farmers and graziers down to small business 
owners have all being doing it pretty hard and all 
have had to work a lot harder and come up with 
more innovative ways to move forward and keep 
their head above water. 

However I am still quietly confident for our North 
West region for the year ahead. I think there has 
been a lot of consolidating done, which will play a 
part in keeping us all moving forward in the 
coming year ahead. There is no doubt the one 
ingredient that will make everyone happy at the 
moment would be some rainfall and hopefully we 
will be delivered a good wet season this year. 

There are some good signs out there that point 
to the fact that there are a lot of good things 
going on in our region at the moment. The live 
export market has been going flat out for the last 
month or two, there is a lot of talk that a 
meatworks of some description will probably be 
built somewhere along the MITEZ corridor, 
Diamantina Power and Leichhardt Stations have 
now been officially opened, Ernest Henry’s 
underground mine and new headframe are now 
completed, Queensland Country Credit Union’s 
new building in Townsville is nearly completed, 
Cudeco’s Rocklands Mine near Cloncurry is 
nearly ready to come on stream, Townsville Port 
recently celebrated 150 years of service and a 
Free Trade Agreement has just been signed with 
China. 

With achievements such as those mentioned as 
well as regional planning activities and initiatives 
to progress in other areas  such as agriculture, 

beef, supply train and transport, together they will 
be the ingredients for the lead-up to a positive 
start moving forward into 2015. 

To all of our members, supporters, stakeholders 
and those we partner with such as the team from 
State Development, I wish you and your families 
a great festive season and a prosperous and 
healthy New Year. 

 
 

David Glasson, President 

 

CEO’S REPORT 

Since our last AGM held at Townsville a year 
ago, it has again been an eventful year for 
MITEZ. 

The year began with plenty of talk by the 
Commonwealth Government on plans to develop 
Northern Australia and as a regional 
development group. MITEZ provided input into 
the process as required. 

January: The North Queensland Resources 
Supply Chain project was wound up with the 
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report’s recommendations being sent onto 
Deputy Premier, Jeff Seeney.  Some of the 
remaining funds were used to undertake a “North 
West Minerals Province Water Demand Study” 
with the balance of funds being set aside for 
additional or future work to be done as required 
by the supply chain technical committee. 

February: MITEZ provided a submission to the 
Queensland Competition Authority highlighting 
concerns about privatisation of the energy supply 
such as Ergon and the need to maintain the CSO 
to keep energy costs for consumers in the north 
on par with consumers in the south. 

March: At a workshop organised by CSIRO at 
Hughenden, stakeholders were briefed on the 
findings and recommendations of the Flinders 
and Gilbert River Ag Study and how potential 
irrigators could go forward and plan projects 
along the river. MITEZ attended this workshop. 

April: MITEZ presented at the public hearing 
held at Mount Isa and in August forwarded a 
submission to the Green Paper. In September 
MITEZ responded to the Commonwealth’s final 
report titled “Pivot North: Enquiry into the 
Development of Northern Australia” which is to 
guide the Commonwealth Government’s future 
policies to be outlined in the “White Paper”.  

May: There was a strong push to promote up-
grading the Hann Highway and a group of 
stakeholders from Shires in the  region met at 
Oak Park, north of Hughenden to discuss 
strategies to progress the project.  At the same 
time head of the Joint Consultative Committee on 
Northern Australia, and Member for Leichhardt, 
Warren Entsch said the proposal to up-grade the 
Hann Highway had been positively received and 
it ranked highly in their final report as one of the 
North’s priority projects. 

At our May Meeting held at Julia Creek, Deputy 
DG, Regional Services Ms Kathy Schaeffer 
officially launched the new look MITEZ branding 
as well as investment opportunity snapshots 
designed to be promoted by Trade and Invest 
Queensland. Visitors to the meeting included 
representatives from Macquarie Bank 
Investments and Trade and Invest Queensland. 

MITEZ has since focussed resources to develop 
investment attraction and marketing strategies 
and become more proactive in seeking potential 
investors to the region through strengthening 
relationships with Trade and Invest Queensland. 
MITEZ project officer, Dr Mark Shadur was 
responsible for the project and also to develop 

new branding and marketing concepts that have 
since been applied to most of MITEZ’s material. 

Also in May, we saw the departure of well-known 
MITEZ member Mark Roberts who was also the 
industry representative on the management 
committee.  Aurizon’s Tony Lucas acted in an 
interim capacity to fill the industry position. 

June: Members of the Joint Consultative 
Committee visited Richmond at the invitation of 
Mayor John Wharton to inspect the proposed 
O’Connell Creek off-stream water storage and 
irrigation project and it is pleasing to see the 
Richmond project is ranked among the priority 
water projects in the Commonwealth’s 
Agricultural Competitiveness Green Paper. 

Earlier in the year our focus was to work closely 
with the consultants, project partners, Mount Isa 
DSDIP team and project chair, Cr Tony McGrady 
to facilitate and project manage the North West 
Development Strategy Study, which included a 
regional summit held at Cloncurry in March.  

At a cost of over $200,000 the final report was 
completed in May and at the invitation of Cr 
McGrady the study was launched in June at 
Mount Isa by the Premier Campbell Newman. 

Since then a number of sub-committees have 
been formed to progress and implement the 
report’s recommendations and action plans. 

July: There were a number of positive 
announcements concerning mining and 
exploration with seven projects in the region 
winning grants to fund half of their drilling cost.  
Also a tender process opened for mining rare 
earth elements and other minerals from tailings 
at the Mary Kathleen mine-site. Uranium prices 
have since risen significantly and there is now 
increased interest from investors and exploration 
companies.  

The MITEZ management committee held a 
strategic planning meeting in July at Townsville  
where they were briefed about the Queensland 
Government’s ‘Strong Choices’ and plans to sell 
or lease the Port of Townsville, Mount Isa to 
Townsville rail line as well as a number of other 
assets. 

MITEZ worked with a facilitator from Queensland 
Treasury receiving further information and 
briefings, including; a telephone link-up with the 
Treasurer and Mayors across the corridor and 
then commenced a process to submit a list of 
potential projects in the MITEZ region possibly to 
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be funded by the proceeds of the sale or lease of 
these assets. 

Priority projects that were submitted included 
completing the sealing of the Hann Highway, an 
additional water storages in the North West 
Minerals Province, contribution to Richmond’s 
O’Connell Creek off-stream storage and capital 
upgrades to the Flinders Highway. 

August: On the State Government front, we saw 
a range of documents coming out as drafts 
seeking our comment such as Water Q; 
Infrastructure Q; Resources Q; Energy Q for 
which MITEZ provided input and submissions. 
Some of these have since been released as 30 
year plans and were followed by the launch in 
Townsville on July 9 of the Regions Q 
Framework by the Deputy Premier. 
Approximately sixty stakeholders from across the 
region attended a Regions Q workshop held at 
Cloncurry. 

MITEZ’s Dr Mark Shadur accepted a position at 
DSDIP in Townsville and after advertising the 
position, Katie Schrodter was engaged to take 
over the MITEZ admin and project functions. 
Katie is well-known along the corridor having 
previously done consultancy and event 
management for a number of the Shires.  

September: Charters Towers Regional Council 
has been progressing plans to develop an 
irrigated cropping precinct on the upper- 
Burdekin and is consulting with relevant 
Government Departments to get through the red 
and green tape to assist farmers on the 
Burdekin. There are some trials of crops 
including some fruits and vegetables that could 
eventually be produce for export. Ramon Jayo 
was invited by MITEZ to attend the NQIAS 
meeting in September to gain a better 
understanding of the role CSIRO can play to 
assist projects by providing advice, science and 
data. 

Following the release by the Deputy Premier in 
July of the recommendations of North 
Queensland Resources Supply Chain Study, the 
first meeting of the supply chain technical 
committee was held September. This group has 
the task of sorting out the day to day issues that 
will result in achieving greater efficiencies 
particularly with Port and rail interface at 
Townsville as well as network issues associated 
with the rail out to Mount Isa. 

BHP Cannington announced it would be affected 
by a demerger within the BHP Billiton group of 

companies and if the demerger was approved 
later in the year the company would then be 
known as NEWCO and the new structure would 
better position the Cannington business to 
compete for capital and project funding such as 
further mine expansion and development 
projects. 

October: Glencore reported improved 
profitability for its Mount Isa operations and also 
reported on prospects for a number of new 
orebodies improving the outlook for its business 
and life of mine. Planning and approval stages 
for the potential black Rock Open Cut project 
would also improve copper production. 

Ernest Henry mine reported the operation’s 
significant progress since the transition from 
open pit to underground shaft mining in June 
2014, with record mine development achieved in 
October. 

November: MITEZ submitted two projects for its 
Queensland Government funded projects for 
2015 and commenced planning layout, content 
and associated material for the Regions Q Expo. 
MITEZ, RAPAD and GSD are included within the 
North and Central West DSDIP area that is to be 
promoted as one region and the groups have 
met to exchange ideas and plan the combined 
display to be open on February 13 for potential 
investors and on February 14 for the general 
public. 

MITEZ’s tourism representative on Outback 
Queensland Tourism Board, Cr Belinda Murphy 
was responsible for the idea to develop the 
Overlanders Way educational tourism project to 
create packages and itineraries for visiting school 
groups to visit centres and attractions along the 
MITEZ corridor (known as Overlander’s Way). 
This project is supported by Outback Tourism 
and Overlanders Way Committee.  

MITEZ were invited to participate in the first 
official underground tour at Glencore’s Lady 
Loretta mine which is now approximately 480 
metres deep and serviced by an incline. With 
relatively high-grade silver-lead-zinc ore, the 
mine, plant, admin and other facilities such as 
accommodation village are state of the art. This 
mine is typical of what may result in other parts 
of the North West when more world-class 
deposits are eventually discovered.  

One such example is MMG’s Dugald River 
project, north of Cloncurry which is one of the 
largest and highest-grade known un-developed 
deposits of zinc, lead and silver in the world. With 
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over 90 workers on site, initial mining trials were 
carried out in 2013 however due to complexity of 
the orebody stoping trials were held in 2014 and 
they are expected to be completed by early 
2015. A geological and geotechnical program is 
now underway to review the findings in relation to 
the entire ore body.  

The year saw a dramatic change in live cattle 
exports with Wellards taking over 250,000 head 
out through Townsville Port in the last 12 
months. Also MITEZ’s Northern Meatworks study 
was used by a Townsville delegation visiting 
China to assist them to attract investor interest 
and there have since been a number of potential 
investor groups visiting Townsville and a number 
of the Shires in the North West. 

Early in 2015, Cloncurry’s new $10.6 million 
heavy vehicle by-pass is expected to be 
completed and is designed to take much of the 
heavy transport passing through Cloncurry away 
from the town centre and community areas. 
Mayor Andrew Daniels and Councillors are very 
pleased with how well this project has run and 
are pleased with the work so far. 

For 2014, most of the region has been suffering 
from the prolonged drought which is putting 
considerable stress on businesses and 
communities across the corridor and it is 
MITEZ’s belief that without water nothing much 
can happen when it comes to developing the 
region. The 2013 CSIRO report, North West 
Development Study 2014 and the more recent 
GHD study report looking future water demand in 
the North West Minerals Province each highlight 
the Cave Hill dam-site as the most likely location 
for a new deep-water storage.  

MITEZ has plans to commission a more detailed 
study in 2015 to look at the best possible solution 
to provide water security for Cloncurry and Mount 
Isa to prevent the threat of future water 
shortages. 

During the year MITEZ also participated on a 
number of other planning activities such as 
implementation of the North Queensland 
Irrigated Agriculture Study with a workshop in 
Hughenden in March; North and North West 
Queensland Sustainable Resources energy 
project (Pentland); Flinders River Ag Precinct 
field day at Richmond in May; Townsville City 
Plan and TEL strategic advisory committee 
meetings. 

As MITEZ CEO, I wish to express my thanks and 
appreciation to our members, sponsors, industry 

partners and colleagues at DSDIP and our own 
team at MITEZ for their continued support and 
for keeping our organisation strong as we remain 
one of Australia’s best performing regional 
development groups. 

 

Glen Graham, Chief Executive Officer 

 

 2014- A YEAR OF CHALLENGES

After hearing our guest Deputy Prime Minister, 
Hon. Warren Truss speak at the last MITEZ 
AGM, the year ahead began with an expectation 
of some good news to come about the 
Commonwealth Government’s plans for 
developing the North. 

During the year, MITEZ participated in the 
process of putting forward our region’s priorities 
by sending in submissions, attending the public 
hearing in Mount Isa and also the conference 
held at Townsville in June. 

After the release of the Green Paper in August, 
we are now keen to see what the White Paper 
has to say that is specific to the MITEZ region. 

 

MITEZ Councillors and Mayors with Deputy Prime 
Minister, Hon. Warren Truss at the 2013 AGM 

This year the State Government initiated a 
number of planning workshops such as Water Q; 
InfrastructureQ; Resources Q; Energy Q for 
which MITEZ provided input and submissions. 
Some of these have since been released as 30 
year plans followed by the launch in Townsville 
on July 9 of the Regions Q Framework by the 
Deputy Premier. In August approximately sixty 
stakeholders from across the region attended a 
Regions Q workshop held at Cloncurry where a 
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range of fresh ideas were identified for 
developing the North West and Gulf.   

MITEZ was also actively involved in our own 
region’s planning activities facilitating the North 
West Development Strategy Study, which 
included a Summit in Cloncurry in March leading 
to the completion of the final report that was 
launched in June at Mount Isa by the Premier. 

  

North West Strategy Study Working Group Julia Creek 

During the year MITEZ also participated on a 
number of other planning activities such as 
implementation of the North Queensland 
Irrigated Agriculture Study with a workshop in 
Hughenden in March; North and North West 
Queensland Sustainable Resources energy 
project (Pentland); Flinders River Ag Precinct 
Filed day at Richmond in May; Townsville City 
Plan and TEL strategic advisory committee 
meetings. 

Following the release by the Deputy Premier in 
July of the recommendations of North 
Queensland Resources Supply Chain Study, the 
first meeting of the supply chain technical 
committee was held in September. This group 
has the task of sorting out the day to day issues 
that will result in achieving greater efficiencies 
particularly with Port and rail interface at 
Townsville as well as network issues associated 
with rail infrastructure out to Mount Isa. 

With the Queensland Government announcing 
‘Strong Choices’ and plans to sell or lease the 
Port of Townsville, Mount Isa to Townsville rail 
line and a number of other assets, MITEZ was 
soon working with a facilitator from Queensland 
Treasury by providing information; organising a 
telephone link-up with the Treasurer and Mayors 
across the corridor and submitting a list of 
potential projects in the MITEZ region possibly to 
be funded by the proceeds of the sale or lease of 
these assets. 

Priority projects that were submitted included 
completing the sealing of the Hann Highway, an 

additional water storages in the North West 
Minerals Province, contribution to Richmond’s 
O’Connell Creek off-stream storage and capital 
upgrades to the Flinders Highway. 

 

Premier Campbell Newman and the Hon. Cr Tony 
McGrady at the launch of the North West Strategy 

Study at Mount Isa in June 

Early this year a decision by Aurizon to 
restructure its operations saw changes along the 
corridor with the main impact on the centres of 
Hughenden and Charters Towers. QR reported 
on its progress to gain further efficiencies 
through track improvements at a number of key 
sections of the line; however total tonnages were 
reduced following the closure of the magnetite 
operations which also affected plans to construct 
a load-out facility near Cloncurry during the year. 

Another area where MITEZ focussed resources 
during the year was to develop investment 
attraction and marketing collateral and become 
more proactive in seeking potential investors to 
the region. 

 

Deputy Director General, Kathy Schaefer launches the 
new MITEZ corporate branding un Julia Creek 

At our May Meeting held at Julia Creek, Deputy 
DG, Regional Services Kathy Schaefer officially 
launched the new look MITEZ branding as well 
as investment opportunity snapshots designed to 
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be promoted by Trade and Invest Queensland. 
Visitors to the meeting included representatives 
from Macquarie Bank Investments and Trade 
and Invest Queensland. MITEZ project officer, Dr 
Mark Shadur was responsible for the project of 
developing the new-look marketing material 
which has since been applied to most of MITEZ’s 
material. 

In August Mark accepted a position with State 
Development at Townsville and he quickly swung 
into action continuing to promote investment 
attraction initiatives across the North and North 
West and in September organised an informative 
investment attraction workshop that was 
attended by Cr John Wharton and MITEZ CEO, 
Glen Graham.  

During the year MITEZ provided support to assist 
groups such as the North West Development 
Strategy; Flinders River Ag Precinct; North Beef; 
Charters Towers Ag Project; Hann Highway 
development; Townsville Enterprise; Overlanders 
Way and OQTA. 

 

McKinlay Shire Mayor Cr Belinda Murphy presented 
with the Local Government Award for Tourism at the 

2014 Outback Queensland Tourism Awards 

With the year coming to a close and despite the 
terrible drought conditions experienced across 
much of the State and especially in the North 
West, there has been some good news stories 
coming out of the region.  

Examples include restoration of the live cattle 
export business, the possibility of an abattoir 
somewhere along the corridor, the Townsville 
Port celebrating 150 years, completion of the 
Diamantina and Leichardt Power Stations and 
Cloncurry’s Weir; release of the CSIRO report on 
the Flinders River; the free trade agreement with 
China and most likely India which will in time 
provide benefits to the mining, agriculture and 
grazing industries. 

 

Diamantina Power Station Mount Isa, officially opened 
December 3, 2014  

This year has not been the best for Cloncurry 
Mayor, Cr Andrew Daniels who is recovering 
from a health issues and on behalf of all of our 
MITEZ members, we wish him a speedy 
recovery and look forward to seeing sitting 
around our table next year. 

 

Despite the poor wet season Cloncurry’s new weir was 
filled in February providing additional water supply for 

the town 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

MITEZ MEMBER COUNCILS: 

 
Townsville City Council 103 Walker Street, Townsville 

P- 1300 878 001 

Charters Towers 
Regional Council             

12 Mosman Street, Charters 
Towers 
P- 07 4761 5300 

Flinders Shire Council 34 Gray Street, Hughenden 
P- 07 4741 2900 

Richmond Shire 
Council             

50 Goldring Street, Richmond 
P- 07 4741 3277 

McKinlay Shire Council  29 Burke Street, Julia Creek 
P- 07 4746 7166   

Cloncurry Shire Council 19 Scarr Street, Cloncurry  
P- 07 4742 4100 

Mount Isa City Council 23 West Street, Mount Isa 
P- 07 4747 3200 
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MEETING ATTENDANCE: 

 
March Charters Towers 31 

May Julia Creek 32 

August Mount Isa 36 

October Richmond 22 

December Townsville (AGM)  35 

 

 

THE MITEZ REGION 

OVERVIEW 

 

The Mount Isa to Townsville Economic Development Zone (MITEZ) extends 920 kilometres inland from its 
most eastern point on the Great Barrier Reef, across North Queensland over the Great Dividing Range, 
and across the outback of North West Queensland to the Northern Territory border. The region covers 
approximately 16% of Queensland’s total land area. 

The MITEZ region encompasses the seven Local Government Areas (LGAs) of: 

 Mount Isa. 

 Cloncurry. 

 McKinlay. 

 Richmond.  

 Flinders.  

 Charters Towers.  

 Townsville.  

The MITEZ region acts as a vital integrated transport corridor, connecting the region and its extensive 
mineral and agricultural production to the rest of Queensland, Australia and internationally via road, rail, air 
and sea links.  

 

 

 

 

 

POPULATION 

As of June 30, 2013 the MITEZ region hosted a resident population of 231,679 persons with an average 
age of 34.7 years.  Over the past five years population growth has averaged 2.1% per annum, with growth 
concentrated in the Townsville and McKinlay LGAs.      
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Local Government Area Resident Population (June 2013) Five Year Average Annual Pop. Growth Average Age (2012) 

Townsville  189,238 2.3% 34.7 

Mount Isa 22,779 1.3% 32.0 

Charters Towers  12,491 0.6% 37.9 

Cloncurry 3,413 0.6% 34.4 

Flinders  1,828 -0.1% 40.9 

McKinlay 1,085 1.8% 35.8 

Richmond  845 -1.1% 38.2 

MITEZ Total 231,679  2.1% 34.7 

Sources: ABS (2014a) Cat No. 3218.0, ABS (2014b) Cat No. 3235.0 

The Townsville LGA is the major population centre for the region with 81.7% of residents, followed by: 

 Mount Isa (9.8% of MITEZ population). 

 Charters Towers (5.4%). 

 Cloncurry (1.5%). 

 Flinders (0.8%).  

 McKinlay (0.5%).  

 Richmond (0.4%). 

The LGAs of Townsville, Mount Isa, Cloncurry and McKinlay possess younger average ages than the 
Queensland average of 37 years. By contrast, Charters Towers and the agricultural centres of Flinders and 
Richmond possess notably higher average ages than Queensland as a whole. 

REGIONAL ECONOMY 

Gross Regional Product 

Over 2012-13 the MITEZ region generated Gross Regional Product (GRP) totalling $19.5 billion (6.7% of 
the Queensland economy).  Over 2012-13 the region recorded strong growth of 11.6%.  

Over the past five years GRP growth has averaged 1.4% per annum compared to 2.5% per annum for 
Queensland as a whole. 

MITEZ Region GRP ($M) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Source: AEC 
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Industry Value Added 

The major industry sectors in the MITEZ region include: 

 Mining 37.2% of Industry Value Added (IVA, i.e. contribution to GRP). 

 Public administration and safety (9.2%). 

 Construction (7.3%). 

 Health care and social assistance (5.9%). 

 Transport, postal and warehousing (4.4%). 

The breakdown of MITEZ industry sectors is provided in the chart below. 

 

MITEZ Region Contribution to IVA (2012-13) 

 

Source: AEC 

The Townsville LGA provides a major contribution to the MITEZ regional economy, with approximately 55% 
of IVA in 2012-13. Accordingly, Townsville’s industry structure strongly influences the MITEZ regional 
industry structure.  

When the Townsville LGA is excluded, the industry contribution to GRP changes significantly.  Across the 
six LGAs from Mount Isa to Charters Towers the major contributing industries are: 

 Mining (76.3% of IVA). 

 Agriculture, forestry and fishing (4.9%).  

 Construction (2.9%).  

 Manufacturing (2.1%).  

Gross Regional Product 

Over 2012-13 the MITEZ region generated Gross Regional Product (GRP) totalling $19.5 billion (6.7% of 
the Queensland economy).  Over 2012-13 the region recorded strong growth of 11.6%.  
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Over the past five years GRP growth has averaged 1.4% per annum compared to 2.5% per annum for 
Queensland as a whole. 

MITEZ Region Contribution to IVA (Excl. Townsville LGA) 

 

Source: AEC 

The MITEZ region is poised for substantial growth over the longer term. Forecasts for Gross Value Added 
(GVA) growth have been developed for the seven LGAs in the region for the MITEZ 50-Year Freight 
Infrastructure Plan. 

It is anticipated that GVA will grow by almost 150%, from an estimated $15 billion in 2011 to approximately 
$40 billion in 2050, as shown in the following chart. 
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The minerals sector is forecast to grow by over 100%, from $2.2 billion to $4.5 billion during this time. 

EMPLOYMENT 

Health care and public administration are the largest sectors of employment in the MITEZ region followed 
by retail trade, construction, education and training, manufacturing, accommodation, and mining.  

Townsville is the major employment centre in the region with over 80% of employment occurring within the 
Townsville LGA.   

Mining is the dominant employment industry in the Mount Isa, Cloncurry and Charters Towers LGAs, while 
agriculture is the major employment sector across the Mid-West LGAs of McKinlay, Richmond and 
Flinders. 

Employment by industry and usual place of residence in the MITEZ region 2011 

 MICC CSC MRC RSC FSC CTRC TCC Total 

Health care 957 80 21 35 37 511 10,904 12,545 

Public admin 619 144 54 57 102 335 10,331 11,642 

Retail trade 831 99 31 28 72 524 9,309 10,894 

Construction 589 140 42 11 53 359 8,572 9,766 

Education, training 714 81 11 22 52 590 7,014 8,484 

Manufacturing 472 95 7 9 23 204 6,615 7,425 

Accommodation 523 84 23 23 44 322 6,036 7,055 

Mining 3,239 318 141 3 8 703 2,541 6,953 

Transport, postal 394 220 23 22 107 234 4,418 5,418 

Professional services 232 14 6 4 6 104 4,054 4,420 

Other services 367 31 9 10 19 183 3,206 3,825 

Administration 303 33 8 4 12 98 2,620 3,078 

Wholesale trade 270 34 0 8 8 97 2,621 3,038 

Agriculture 118 206 270 182 317 567 468 2,128 

Real estate 147 9 7 0 7 53 1,385 1,608 

Utilities 133 7 4 5 8 30 1,373 1,560 

Financial services 82 18 3 9 9 36 1,392 1,549 

Information, telecoms 66 8 0 0 0 28 1,205 1,307 

Arts and recreation 30 5 0 4 3 20 1,125 1,187 

Total 10,086 1,626 660 436 887 4,998 85,189 103,882 

 
Source: Australian Bureau of Statistics Population Census of 2011 

  OCCUPATION

The main occupational groups across the MITEZ region are technicians and tradespersons, professionals, 
and clerical and administrative employees.  The MITEZ region as a whole features a strong balance of 
worker skills, with no occupational sector contributing more than 17.5% or less than 9.3% of total 
employment.  

Occupation by usual place of residence in the MITEZ region 2011 

 MICC CSC MSC RSC FSC CTRC TCC Total 

Technicians, trades 2,318 273 85 42 94 830 14,570 18,212 

Professionals 1,556 207 51 35 61 628 15,058 17,596 

Clerical, admin 1,159 201 48 38 86 481 12,477 14,490 

Community service 834 100 23 28 56 444 10,600 12,085 

Labourers 951 254 120 102 146 743 8,636 10,952 

Managers 831 202 189 139 272 748 8,501 10,882 

Machinery, drivers 1,762 327 129 39 120 748 7,135 10,260 

Sales Workers 664 78 27 23 50 406 8,453 9,701 

Total 10,075 1,642 672 446 885 5,028 85,430 104,178 
 
Source: Australian Bureau of Statistics Population Census of 2011 
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MITEZ MEMBERS AND SPONSORS 

  CONTRIBUTORS TO MITEZ PROJECTS 2013-14

North West Queensland Strategic Development Strategy Study 

MITEZ Contributors GSD Contributors 

Queensland Government Carpentaria Shire Council 

Queensland Resources Council (mining 
companies) 

Burke Shire Council 

Mount Isa City Council Etheridge Shire Council 

Cloncurry Shire Council Croydon Shire 

McKinlay Shire Council Doomadgee Shire 

Richmond Shire Council Ports North 

Flinders Shire Council MMG 

Regional Development Australia  

Port of Townsville  

Queensland Rail  

Diamantina Power Station  

 

Investment Attraction and Marketing 

MITEZ Funds 

Queensland State Government 

 

Valued In-kind Supporters 

Queensland State Government DSDIP Mount Isa office administrative support 

Commerce North West Administrative support 

Queensland Country Credit Union Account-keeping and financial 
administration 

Emanate Legal Legal advice 

QantasLink Sponsored air travel Mount Isa to 
Townsville 

Bell and Moir Toyota Mount Isa Sponsored Toyota Landcruiser with full 
servicing 
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For Further information regarding MITEZ please visit our website: http://www.mitez.com.au 

Mount Isa to Townsville Economic Zone Inc 

PO Box 1258 Mount Isa QLD 4825 

Chief Executive Officer Glen Graham 

T: 07 4743 3488 E: ceo@mitez.com.au 

 

  MITEZ MEMBERS

MITEZ Members we thank you for your support  

 


